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ecommendation of $500,000 or Less- FY20-120 - Fertilizers, Pesticides, & Lawn Chemicals 

pprove the recommendation to award the above Invitation to Bid (ITB). Contract Tenn: November 1, 2019through October 30, 2020, 1 Year with an option for 

wo (2) additional one (1) year renewal periods; User Department: Physical Plant Operations (PPO); Award Amount: $355,000; Award Vendor(s): Diamond R. 

ertilizer Co., Inc.; Harrell's LLC; Florida Irrigation Supply, Inc.; MAR Green Resources LLC; SileOne Landscape Supply, LLC; Sunniland Corporation: 

maiVMinority/Women Business Enterprise Vendor(s): None. 

SUMMARY EXPLANATION AND BACKGROUND: 

he School Board of Broward County, Florida (SBBC), received six (6) bids for ITB 17-021B- Fertilizers, Pesticides & Lawn Chemicals. PPO purchases lawn 

hemicals and pesticides to maintain and manage the District's fields, lawns, common grounds, and landscapes. 

~ copy of the bid documents are available online at: 

lltp://www.broward.k12.fl.us/supply/agenda/FY20-120_Fertilizers,Peslicides,&LawnChemicals.pdf 

SCHOOL BOARD GOALS: 

0 Goal1: High Quality Instruction @ Goal 2: Safe & Supportive Environment 0 Goal 3: Effective Communication 

FINANCIAL IMPACT: 

~he estimated financial impact to the District will be $355,000. The funding source will come from PPO's operating budget. The financial impact amount represents 

an estimated contract value: however, the amount authorized will not exceed the estimated contract award amount. 

EXHIBITS: (List) 

(1) Executive Summary (2) Financial Analysis Worksheet (3) Recommendation Tabulation (4) ITB Fertilizers Pesticides and Lawn Chemicals 
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EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

 

Recommendation of $500,000 or Less 

FY20-120 - Fertilizers, Pesticides, & Lawn Chemicals 

 
 

Introduction 

Responsible: Procurement & Warehousing Services (PWS) 
 

This request is to approve the recommendation to award Invitation to Bid (ITB) FY20-120 - Fertilizers, 

Pesticides, & Lawn Chemicals for a period of one (1) year from November 1, 2019 through October 30, 

2020, with two (2) one (1) year additional options to renew. FY20-120 - Fertilizers, Pesticides, & Lawn 

Chemicals was issued to replace the previous ITB 17-021B – Fertilizers, Pesticides, and Related Lawn 

Chemicals. The requested spending authority for this ITB is $355,000. 
 

Goods/Services Description 

Responsible: Physical Plant Operations (PPO) 
 

This Bid will be used by Physical Plant Operations (PPO) to purchase lawn chemicals and pesticides to 

maintain and manage the District’s fields, lawns, common grounds, and landscapes. These products have 

been approved by the District’s Risk Management Department and are applied by District certified 

technicians. 
 

Procurement Method 

Responsible: PWS  
 

The solicitation for this ITB ran from July 31, 2019 through August 29, 2019. One hundred and fifty-eight 

(158) vendors were notified, and Sixteen (16) vendors downloaded the ITB documentation. Procurement 

& Warehousing Services (PWS) received six (6) responses. The bid has a primary and up to three (3) 

alternate vendors who met all specifications, terms, and conditions of the ITB. Including alternate awardees 

allows for continuity of services in the event that the primary vendor cannot comply with delivery 

requirements, specifications, or in emergency cases. 

 

This Bid is only for an original one (1) year period as the market for fertilizers and pesticides, which are 

petrochemicals, is volatile and price varies often. As a commodity, it is best to do a one (1) year contract 

and assess the market on an annual basis.  

 

The Affirmative Procurement Initiative recommended by the Supplier Diversity and Outreach Program for 

this Bid is the Voluntary S/M/WBE Distributorship Development Program in which The School Board of 

Broward County, Florida, encourages manufacturers to establish authorized dealerships or distributorships 

with S/M/WBE suppliers of their products on a non-discriminatory basis. 

 

Financial Impact 

Responsible: PWS and PPO 
 

The total spending authority estimated is $355,000 as calculated below:  

 

Projected Average Monthly Expenditures       $29,375 

Number of months     *  12  

Estimated forecasted spend       $352,496  

Total spend authority (rounded)      $355,000 

 

 



 

Recommendation of $500,000 or Less 

FY20-120 - Fertilizers, Pesticides, & Lawn Chemicals 

October 2, 2019 Board Agenda  
Page 2 

 

PWS is responsible for the control of the District contracts’ spending authority. This action is performed 

through the unique Bid Id issued per solicitation, which only has a new number assigned when a new 

solicitation is awarded. In a renewal, the original Bid Id assigned to the contract does not change, therefore 

spending authority analysis is performed in its totality.  

 

The amount requested was determined based on PPO’s requirements to satisfy the needs of the District, and 

a comparison of expenditures from the previous bid term. The financial impact amount represents an 

estimated contract value; however, the amount authorized will not exceed the contract award amount.  

 

 



New Bid # (Ex: 10-004R): FY20-120 Preparation Date: September 6, 2019

Previous Bid # (Ex: 10-004R): 17-021B Buyer/PA: AL SHELTON

New Bid Award Total: $355,000

Previous Award Total: $1,400,000

Bid Type: RENEWAL OF BID

Previous Bid Term (Start Date): 11/1/2016 New Bid Term (In Months): 12

Previous Bid Term (End Date): 10/31/2019 # of Months Into Bid: 34

Purchase Order(s) Spend:

P Card Purchases:

Total Invoiced-to-Date Amount (PO + Pcard Purchases):

Average Monthly Expenditure:

Unused Authorized Spending:

Est. Forecasted Spend (For Entire Bid Term):

Awarded Vendors: Spend:

103853-DIAMOND R FERTILIZER CO INC 397,717$                                                   

128901-SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY LLC 321,140$                                                   

106715-SUNNILAND CORPORATION 279,880$                                                   

998,738$                                                   

-$                                                           

998,738$                                                   

NOTES (Type Below):

Cost Center 1340096080 Name (First & Last) Sam Bays
Fund 1000 Title Director
Functional Area 8105660000000000 Department/School Name Physical Plant Operations

Commitment Item 59900100 Sign-off provided by Jeffrey Whitney

Prepared on: 9/15/2019

VENDOR INFORMATION

FINANCIAL ANALYSIS WORKSHEET

BID INFORMATION

Bid Title:
FERTILIZERS, PESTICIDES, AND 

RELATED LAWN CHEMICALS

SPEND REPORTING

$998,738

$0

$998,738

$29,375

$401,262

$352,496

M/WBE Status (If applicable):

Default Funding Source* Department/School & Sign-off Information*

Data Source: SAP and Works (Bank of America system)

All information included in this summary is based on the preparation date listed above and may change at any time beyond that date.

PO VENDOR SPEND:

P-CARD SPEND:

TOTAL SPEND:

*To ensure accuracy, pease type in or select from the menu for the Default Funding Source and Department Information (No hand written information) 



 

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression,  
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation.  Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158. 
 Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities  

(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158. 
REVISED: 5/19/2017 

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

 

ITB #: FY20-120  Tentative Board Meeting Date*: 10/2/2019 

 
ITB Title: FERTILIZERS, PESTICIDES, & LAWN   # Notified: 158 # Downloaded:       16 
 EQUIPMENT  
                            # of Responses Rec’d: 6 # of “No Bids”: 1 
 
For: PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS  ITB Opening Date: 8/29/2019 
 (School/Department) 
Fund: OPERATING BUDGET  Advertised Date: 7/31/2019  

  
  

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & 
Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on 9/9/2019 @ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours.  Any person who is adversely affected 
by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended decision. 
The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or failure to file 
a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The formal written 
protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during which the 
District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of Procurement 
& Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting an intended 
decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, 
Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, 
Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest. 
 
(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC.  The Board meeting 
date stated above is tentative.  Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.  
 

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 
 

VENDOR NAME(s)     ITEM(S) AWARDED 
 
DIAMOND R FERTILIZER CO., INC.   PRIMARY: 3, 5, 7, 8, 9, 11, 12, 14, 16, 17, 22, 26, 29, AND 38  
      ALTERNATE: 2, 4, 6, 13, 19, 21, 23, 30, 31, 32, 34, 36, 37, 39, 40, 41, AND 42 
 
FLORIDA IRRIGATION SUPPLY, INC.  PRIMARY: 1, 2, 4, 13, 18, 30, 31, 32, 33, 39, AND 42 
D/B/A FIS OUTDOOR, INC ALTERNATE: 3, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 14, 15, 16, 17, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 26, 27, 28, 34, 36, 38, 

40, AND 41 
 
HARRELL'S, INC.     PRIMARY: 15, 28, 34, 36, 40, 41, AND 44 

ALTERNATE: 1. 2, 6, 7, 8, 11, 12, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 23, 24, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 37, 38, 
AND 42 

 
MAR GREEN RESOURCES, LLC PRIMARY: 20 

ALTERNATE: 3, 6, 8, 9, 12, 16, 19, 33, 35, AND 37 
 
SITEONE LANDSCAPE SUPPLY, LLC  PRIMARY: 19, 21, 23, 24, 27, 35, AND 37 

ALTERNATE: 1, 4, 10, 12, 13, 14, 15, 17, 18, 20, 22, 26, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 36, 38, 
39, 40, 41, 42, AND 44 

 
SUNNILAND CORPORATION   PRIMARY: 6 AND 10  
      ALTERNATE: 2, 3, 4, 5, 7, 8, 9 AND 11  
 
IN ORDER TO MEET THE NEEDS OF THE SCHOOL SYSTEM AND IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE SCHOOL BOARD, THE ABOVE 
ITEMS ARE RECOMMENDED TO BE AWARDED TO THE BIDDER LISTED.  ITEMS 25 AND 43: NO BIDS RECEIVED. ITEMS WILL NOT 
BE REBID AT A LATER DATE. 
 
CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2019 THROUGH OCTOBER 30, 2020. 
 
 

By:  Date: 9/9/2019 
(Purchasing Agent) 

 

http://www.demandstar.com/


FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Company Name Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc.
Company Representative Thom Chester
Email Address thomchester@comcast.net
Phone Number 772-201-0099
Fax Number 772-464-9308
Website Address www.diamond-r.com
Street Address 4100 Galdes Cutoff Road
City Ft Pierce
State Florida
Zip Code 34981
After Hours Contact Thom Chester  772-201-0099

Company Name Harrell's, LLC
Company Representative Tristan Rosado
Email Address trosado@harrells.com
Phone Number 954-815-6089
Fax Number 863-688-8836
Website Address https://www.harrells.com/
Street Address 1930 NE 27th Ct
City Lighthouse Point
State Florida
Zip Code 33064

Company Name MAR Green Resources LLC
Company Representative Kriss Ramroop
Email Address sales@margreenresources.com
Phone Number 561-791-6298
Fax Number TBD
Website Address www.margreenresources.com
Street Address 113 Van Gogh Way
City Royal Palm Beach
State FL
Zip Code 33411
After Hours Contact 561-791-6298

Bidder Info

Bid Summary Sheet Page 1

mailto:thomchester@comcast.net
mailto:trosado@harrells.com
mailto:sales@margreenresources.com
http://www.margreenresources.com/


FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Bidder Info
Company Name SiteOne Landscape Supply
Company Representative Bids Department
Email Address bids@siteone.com
Phone Number 216-706-9250
Fax Number 248-581-1433
Website Address www.siteone.com
Street Address 1385 East 36th Street
City Cleveland
State OH
Zip Code 44114
After Hours Contact Bethany Tito @ 786-582-5333

Company Name Sunniland Corporation
Company Representative Erik J. Thor
Email Address eriksusan@bellsouth.net
Phone Number 954-383-5638
Fax Number 407-330-0122
Website Address Sunnilandcorp.com
Street Address 1735 State Road 419
City Longwood
State Florida
Zip Code 32750
After Hours Contact Erik J Thor 954-383-5638

Company Name Florida Irrigation Supply
Company Representative Casie Lee
Email Address Insidesales@FISOutdoor.com
Phone Number 407-995-9095
Fax Number 907-995-9793
Website Address FISOutdoor.com
Street Address 300 Central Park Drive
City Sanford
State FL
Zip Code 32771

Bid Summary Sheet Page 2
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FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
EPA Registration #: N/A N/A N/A

Brand Offered:
Southern Agricultural 

Insecticides, Inc
Harrell's MAX Non-

Staining Iron
Lesco Chelated Iron Plus 

12-0-0
Delivery Time Required: 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              14.98  $                              26.23  $                              18.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: N/A N/A N/A N/A F99

Brand Offered:
<R> Big W Brand

Harrell's 0-0-22 Sul-Po-
Mag 

MAR Green Lesco 0-0-20 10% Mg Sunniland/Mosaic

Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-7 days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.26  $                                0.22  $                                0.30  $                                0.31  $                                0.35  $                                0.29 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: N/A F1622 N/A N/A F99
Brand Offered: <R> Big W Brand Harrell's 0-0-30 MAR Green Lesco 0-0-28 Elite Sunniland
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-7 Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Bags per ton: 40 40 40 40 40 40
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.42  $                                0.44  $                                0.55  $                                0.44  $                                0.95  $                                0.46 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: N/A N/A N/A N/A
Brand Offered: Milorganite Classic Southern AG Milorganite Classic Milorganite Classic
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Bags per ton: 40 40 40 40
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.25  $                                0.23  $                                0.28  $                                0.27 

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Item 1: Liquid Chelated Iron (2.5 Gallon Jug)

Item 2: 0-0-20 SUL-PO-MAG

Item 4: 6-2-0 Milorganite Classic NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Item 3: 0-0-28 Potassium Sulfate Plus

Bid Summary Sheet Page 3



FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: N/A F1622 N/A N/A F-99

Brand Offered:
<R> Big W Brand Harrell's 15-0-22 MAR Green

Lesco 15-0-22 50% 
Polyplus 2Fe 2Mn 2Mg 

MOP/SOP
Sunniland

Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-7  Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Bags per ton: 40 40 40 40 40 40
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.34  $                                0.37  $                                0.39  $                                0.39  $                                0.43  $                                0.34 
*Tie Bids Received. Award is to Diamond R Fertilizer based on Coin Toss permfromed 9/9/2019.

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: N/A F1622 N/A N/A F-99

Brand Offered:
<R> Big W Brand Harrell's 12-2-14 MAR Green

Lesco 12-2-14 
56%Polyplus 425%Fe 

2.2%Mg 2.8%Mn
Sunniland

Delivery Time Required: 5 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-7 Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Bags per ton: 40 40 40 40 40 40
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.42  $                                0.39  $                                0.46  $                                0.41  $                                0.44  $                                0.38 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: N/A N/A 52287-1 N/A 53883-180-9404

Brand Offered:
<R> Turf Care Supply Corp

Harrell's 0.95% Ronstar 
20-1-20

Lesco Ronstar 0.95% 20-
1-20M 85% Polyplus

Sunniland

Delivery Time Required: 5 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Bags per ton: 40 40 40 40 40
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.71  $                                0.78  $                                0.90  $                                0.87  $                                0.76 

No Bid

Item 7: 20-1-20 Plus Ronstar

Item 6: 12-2-14 Landscape Ornamental and Fertilizer

Item 5: 15-0-22 Fertilizer

Bid Summary Sheet Page 4



FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: N/A F1622 N/A N/A F-99
Brand Offered: <R> Big W Brand Harrell's 21-0-0 AS MAR Green Lesco 21-0-0 100% AS Sunniland/Koch
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-7 Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Bags per ton: 40 40 40 40 40 40
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.21  $                                0.22  $                                0.27  $                                0.27  $                                0.27  $                                0.24 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: N/A F1622 N/A N/A F-99

Brand Offered:
<R> Big W Brand Harrell's 19-0-19 MAR Green

Lesco 19-0-19M 
100%Polyplus 1%Fe

Sunniland

Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-7 Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Bags per ton: 40 40 40 40 40 40
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.29  $                                0.31  $                                0.41  $                                0.34  $                                0.51  $                                0.33 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 50 50 50
EPA Registration #: 82757-1 N/A 9404-51

Brand Offered:

Turf Care Supply Corp
Lesco Atrazine 1.05% 22-
0-11M 40%Polyplus AS 

1%Fe .5%Mn
Sunniland

Delivery Time Required: 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Bags per ton: 40 40 40
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.41  $                                0.48  $                                0.33 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 55 50 50 50 55
EPA Registration #: N/A N/A N/A

No Bid No Bid No Bid

 

Item 8: AMMONIUM SULFATE 21-0-0 (Sulfate of ammonia)

Item 11: Tecmangan Monohydrated Manganese Sulfate

Item 9: 19-0-19 Fertilizer

Item 10: 22-0-11 plus Atrazine Weed Control

Bid Summary Sheet Page 5



FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Brand Offered:
Manganese Sulfate BR Global

Harrell's Manganese 
Sulfate mini

Tecmangam Mini Prill Erachem

Bags per ton: 40 40 40 40 36
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                                0.63  $                                0.68  $                                0.71  $                                0.69  $                                0.69 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 25 25 25 25
EPA Registration #: 73342-1-2724 241-322 73342-1-2724 241-322

Brand Offered:
Pro Bait Amdro Pro Fire Ant Bait Zoecon Probait Amdro Pro

Bags per ton: 80 80 80 80
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 5-10 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                                5.99  $                              13.20  $                                6.68  $                              14.48 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 30 30 30
EPA Registration #: 59639-215 59639-215 59639-215
Brand Offered: Aloft LC Granular Aloft LC Granular Aloft LC G
Bags per ton: 80 80 66 +
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                                1.90  $                                1.48  $                                1.90 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Jug: 64 64 64
EPA Registration #: 66330-336 59639-212 59639-212
Brand Offered: Aloft LC Sc Aloft GC SC Aloft GC SC
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            569.30  $                            569.30  $                            569.30 
*Tie Bids Received. Award is to X based on Coin Toss permfromed 9/9/2019.

Rejected

No Bid

No Bid

Item 14: Aloft LC SC

Item 13: Aloft LC Granular

No BidNo Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 12: Amdro

Bid Summary Sheet Page 6



FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells* Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
EPA Registration #: 432-1513 432-1513 432-1513

Brand Offered:
Bayer Aramada 50 WDG Bayer Aramada 50 WDG Armada 50 WDG

Delivery Time Required: 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            105.86  $                            102.87  $                              98.00 
*Award based on Florida Bidders' Preference.

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland

Brand Offered:
Diablo Southern AG

Agri-Star : Dicamba DMA 
Salt

EPA Registration #: 228-379 42750-40 42750-40
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 5-10 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            159.50  $                            216.50  $                            250.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland

Brand Offered:
Primera One 

Prodiamine 4L
Syngenta Barricade 4FL Syngenta Barricade 4FL Lesco Stonewall 4L

EPA Registration #: 66222-230 100-1139 100-1139 60063-67-10404
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              83.30  $                            143.00  $                            143.00  $                            183.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Container: 32 32 32
Gallons per Container: N/A 0.25 0.25
Brand Offered: Tank Cleaner Select Harrell's Tank Cleaner LescoSol
EPA Registration #: N/A N/A
Delivery Time Required: 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              18.52  $                              44.00  $                              22.00 

No Bid No BidNo Bid

No Bid No Bid

Item 18: Chemical Neutralizer Soap

Item 17: Barricade 4FL Herbicide (2.5 Gallon Jug)

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 16: Banvel (2.5 Gallon Jug)

Item 15: Armada 50 WDG Fungicide (2 Pound Jug)

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary Sheet Page 7



FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Bottle: 1.25 1.25 1.25 1.25 1.25
Bottles per Case: 10 10 10 10 10

Brand Offered:
Certainty Certainty

Valent Certainty Turf 
Herbicide

Nufarm/Valent Certainty

EPA Registration #: 524-534 524-534 59639-226 59639-226 59639-226
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-7 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              83.12  $                              93.05  $                              81.67  $                              75.00  $                              68.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Jug: 16 16 16 16 16
Jugs per Case: 8 8 8 8 8

Brand Offered:
Dismiss South Dismiss South

FMC Dismiss South 
Herbicide 

FMC Dismiss South

EPA Registration #: 279-3351 279-3352 279-3351 279-3351 279-3351
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-10 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            190.00  $                            171.88  $                            158.26  $                            144.00  $                            160.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland

Brand Offered:
Primera One Quinclorac 

4L
Drive XLR8 BASF Drive XLR8 Drive XLR8

EPA Registration #: 29091-21-2 7969-272 7969-272 7969-272
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              54.20  $                              66.16  $                              67.80  $                              48.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Jugs per Case: 2 2 2
Brand Offered: Ranger Pro Glyphosate Lesco Prosecutor Pro
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
EPA Registration #: 524-517 72112-4 524-539-10404
Cost per Unit:  $                              66.15  $                              69.98  $                              72.86 

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Item 19: Certainty Turf Herbicide (1.3 Ounce Bottle)

Item 22: Glyphosate Pro GENERIC (2.5 Gallon Jug)

Item 21: Drive XLR8 (1/2 Gallon Jug)

Item 20: Dismiss South Herbicide

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid
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FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Bottle: 32 16 32 16
Brand Offered: <R> Exterminator Amega Science Harrell's Defoamer Lesco Recede
EPA Registration #: N/A N/A N/A
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              10.20  $                                5.76  $                              13.62  $                                4.25 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Container: 32 32 32

Brand Offered:
Lontrel T&O

Corteva Agriscience 
(Dow) Lontrel T&O

Lontrel T&O

EPA Registration #: 62719-305 62719-305 62719-305
Delivery Time Required: 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                                4.92  $                                5.25  $                                4.51 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Jugs per Case:
Brand Offered:
EPA Registration #:
Delivery Time Required:
Cost per Unit:

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Jug: 108.8 108.8 108.8
Brand Offered: RoundUp Quick Pro Roundup Quikpro Roundup Quikpro
EPA Registration #: 524-535 524-535 524-535
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              61.30  $                              62.99  $                              72.84 

Item 23: Liquid Antifoam / Defoamer

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 26: QUIKPRO Herbicide

Item 25: ProDuece (1 Gallon Jug)

Item 24: Lontrel Turf and Ornamental Herbicide

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Jugs per Case: 2 2

Brand Offered:
Select Source LLC

Roundup Pro 
Concentrate

Delivery Time Required: 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
EPA Registration #: 524-535 524-529
Cost per Unit:  $                            100.90  $                              94.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Bottle: 32 87 87
Brand Offered: Bayer Revolver Bayer Revolver Revolver
EPA Registration #: 432-1266 432-1266 432-1266
Delivery Time Required: 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            251.28  $                            588.50  $                            588.50 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Ounces per Container: 80 80 80
Brand Offered: Tricor 75DF Bayer Sencor 75DF Sencor 75
EPA Registration #: 70506-103 432-1469 432-1469
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                                1.48  $                                4.88  $                                5.28 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Jugs per Case: 4 4 4 4
Brand Offered: UpStar Gold FMC Talstar P FMC Talstar P Talstar P
EPA Registration #: 70506-24 279-3206 279-3206 279-3206
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            204.32  $                            186.68  $                            200.00  $                            212.00 

No Bid No Bid

Item 27: Round-up PRO NO SUBSTITUTIONS (2.5 Gallon Jug)

Item 30: Talstar ONE Insecticide (1 Gallon Jug)

Item 28: Revolver Herbicide

Item 29: Sencor 75 D.F.

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per container: 30 30 50 50

Brand Offered:
Fipronil Broadcast Fipronil

Bayer TopChoice 
Insecticide 

TopChoice (Agency)

EPA Registration #: 53883-272-66222 53883-272-66222 432-1217 67572-GA-1
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                                1.60  $                                1.33  $                                2.53  $                                2.78 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Jugs per Case: 2 2 2 2
Brand Offered: Weedar 64 Weedar Drexel 2-4D Amine Weedar 64 
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
EPA Registration #: 71368-1 71368-1 19713-650 71368-1
Cost per Unit:  $                              64.00  $                              60.00  $                              69.46  $                            108.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland

Brand Offered:
Award II Syngenta Award II 

Syngenta Advion Fire Ant 
Bait 25lb

Award II

Delivery Time Required: 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 5-10 Days 3-5 Days
EPA Registration #: 100-1452 100-1452 100-1481 100-1452
Cost per Unit:  $                            284.57  $                            309.11  $                            330.00  $                            279.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Jugs per Case: 2 2 2 2

Brand Offered:
Aqua Aid Immerse Fairway

Harrell's Nonionic 
Penetrant

Lesco-Wet Plus

EPA Registration #: N/A N/A N/A
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            120.00  $                            114.36  $                              95.64  $                            137.00 

No Bid No Bid

Item 34: Concentrated Wetting and Penetrating Agent (2.5 Gallon Jug)

Item 33: Award II Fire Ant Bait (25 Pound Bag)

Item 32: Weedar 64 Herbicide (2.5 Gallon Jug)

Item 31: Chipco Top Choice Granular

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
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FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Pounds per Bag: 40 40
Brand Offered: Nisus Corp :Niban Niban
Delivery Time Required: 5-7 Days 3-5 Days
EPA Registration #: 64405-2 64405-2
Cost per Unit:  $                                2.50  $                                2.38 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Brand Offered: Imidacloprid 0.5G Merit Bayer Criterion 0.5G Merit 0.5G
EPA Registration #: 432-1328-73220 432-1328 432-1328 3125-451
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              27.00  $                              30.05  $                              20.80  $                              32.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Gallons per Container: 5 2.5 2.5 2.5

Brand Offered:
<R> Chelated Minors w/ 

N
Harrell's 12-0-0 w/ 

Umaxx 6%Fe 3%Mn
MAR Green 12N Plus 

Minors
Lesco Chelated Iron Plus 

12-0-0
EPA Registration #: N/A N/A N/A F15660
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-7 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                                9.98  $                                9.26  $                                7.98  $                                7.20 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Jugs per Case: 2 2 2 2 2
Brand Offered: Interline Finale Nufarm Cheetah Pro Bayer: Finale 2 Finale
EPA Registration #: 70506-310 432-1229 228-743 432-1229 432-1229
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-7 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            118.00  $                            124.47  $                            144.44  $                            160.00  $                            142.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland

Rejected

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

Item 37: Liquid Chelated Iron with Micronutrients (Lesco 12-0-0)

Item 36: Merit .5G Insecticide (30 Pound Bag)

Item 35: Niban

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 39: Taurus Trio G (30 Pound Bag)

Item 38: Finale Herbicide (2.5 Gallon Jug)
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FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Brand Offered: Taurus Trio G Taurus Trio G Taurus Trio G
EPA Registration #: 53883-272 72116 53883-381
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              70.80  $                              70.20  $                              75.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland

Brand Offered:
Advion FAB Advion Fire Ant Bait

Syngenta Advion Fire 
Ant Bait

Syngenta Advion Fire Ant 
Bait 25lb

Advion Fire Ant Bait

EPA Registration #: 352-627 100-1481 100-1481 100-1481 100-1481
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 5-10 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            306.50  $                            292.55  $                            286.00  $                            330.00  $                            282.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland

Brand Offered:
Advion MCB Advion

Syngenta Advion Insect 
Granule 

Advion Insect Granule Advion Insect Granule

EPA Registration #: 352-651 100-1481 100-1483 100-1483 100-1483
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 5-7 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                              70.50  $                              67.29  $                              65.00  $                              82.00  $                              68.00 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Brand Offered: Sure Guard Nufarm Sureguard SC Nufarm Sureguard SC SureGuard SC
EPA Registration #: 71368-114 71368-114 71368-114 71368-114
Delivery Time Required: 3 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                            550.95  $                            545.00  $                            550.95  $                            550.95 

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Jugs per Case:
Delivery Time Required:
Cost per Unit:

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 43: EcoMIGHT W.O.W. (Whack out Weeds!) Non-Selective Weed and Grass Killer (2.5 Gallon Jug)

Item 40: Advion Fire Ant Bait (25 Pound Bag)

Item 41: Advion Mole Cricket Bait (25 Pound Bag)

Item 42: Sure Guard SC (64 Ounce Bottle)

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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FY20-120 Fertilizers, 
Pesticides, Lawn Chemicals

Description Diamond R Fertilizer FIS Outdoor Harrells Mar Green SiteOne Sunniland
Brand Offered: Bayer Indemnify Indemnify
EPA Registration #: 432-1543 432-1543
Delivery Time Required: 3-5 Days 3-5 Days
Cost per Unit:  $                        1,700.00  $                        1,700.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Item 44: Indemnify (17.1 Fluid Ounces Jug)
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BID FY20-120 
Fertilizers, Pesticides, & Lawn Chemicals  

Bid Rejection and Information Sheet 
 

Tie Bids were received for Item 5 – 15-0-22 Fertilizer from Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc. and Sunniland 
Corporation. Tie Breaker was broken in accordance with General Condition 50, Tie Bid Procedures, “If 
application of the above criteria does not indicate a priority for award, the award shall be indicated by a 
coin toss.”  For Awardee, a coin toss was held publically on 9/9/2019 at 9:30 AM to break the tie. Diamond 
R Fertilizer Co., Inc was selected Heads and Sunniland Corporation was selected Tails. The toss yielded 
Heads and the recommendation will be made to Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc. 
 
Tie Bids were received for Item 14 - Aloft LC SC from Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc and Florida Irrigation 
Supply Inc. Tie Breaker was broken in accordance with General Condition 50, Tie Bid Procedures, “If 
application of the above criteria does not indicate a priority for award, the award shall be indicated by a 
coin toss.”  For Awardee, a coin toss was held publically on 9/9/2019 at 9:30 AM to break the tie. Florida 
Irrigation Supply Inc. was selected Heads and Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc. was selected Tails. The toss 
yielded Tails and the recommendation will be made to Diamond R Fertilizer Co., Inc. 
 
Reject Bid from Florida Irrigation Supply Inc for Item 12: Amdro. As per the Bid’s Section 3, General 
Condition 6 – AWARDS:  

“In the best interest of SBBC, SBBC reserves the right to: … 2) to reject any or all bids received 
when there are sound documented business reasons that serve the best interest of SBBC...” 
 

Reject Bid from Florida Irrigation Supply Inc for Item 37: Liquid Chelated Iron with Micronutrients 
(Lesco 12-0-0). Bidder did not provide Product Label and Certification. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special 
Condition 23 – PRODUCT LABEL AND CERTIFICATION OF ANALYSIS:  

“Bidders must submit, with their bid, a copy of the product label of each item offered, and 
certification of the guaranteed analysis of fertilizers as specified herein. Failure to submit the 
product label(s) and certification with the bid will result in disqualification of bid item. All product 
labels and certifications shall have the bid item number stated on the upper right corner of the front 
page and in numerical order, in order to assist in the evaluation of the bid.” 
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